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Abo u t  
 
Magnetic resonance (MR) urography is 
performed to obtain images of the urinary tract 
system. MR urography (MRU) are used as 
primary imaging techniques to evaluate patients 
with blood in the urine (hematuria), follow patients 
with prior history of cancers of the urinary 
collecting system and to identify abnormalities in 
patients with recurrent urinary tract infections. 
 
During the MR urography scan, the technologist 
will begin by positioning you on the MRI 
examination table, usually lying flat on your back 
or possibly on your side or stomach. You may be 
asked to change positions during portions of the 
examination. Devices that contain coils capable 
of sending and receiving radio waves may be 
placed around or adjacent to the area of the 
body being studied. 
 
If a contrast material will be used in the urography 
exam, a nurse or technologist will insert an 
intravenous (IV) line into a vein in your hand or 
arm. You will be moved into the magnet of the 
MRI unit and the radiologist and technologist will 
leave the room while the MRI examination is 
performed. 
 
When the examination is completed, you may be 
asked to wait until the technologist or radiologist 
checks the images in case additional images are 
needed. Your intravenous line will be removed. 
 
MRI exams generally include multiple runs, some 
of which may last several minutes. 
 

P rep a ra t i on s  
 
If you are scheduled for an MR urography exam, 
you will be asked to wear a gown during the 
exam. 
 
In order to distend your urinary bladder, you may 
be asked to drink water prior to the examination, 
and also not to urinate until after the scan is 
complete. However, guidelines about eating and 
drinking before an MRI exam vary with the specific 
exam. For some types of exams, you will be asked 
to fast for eight to 12 hours. Unless you are told 
otherwise, you may follow your regular daily 
routine and take medications as usual. 
 
If you are scheduled to undergo MR urography, 
you may have contrast material injected 
intravenously for the exam. The radiologist or 
technologist may ask if you have asthma or 
allergies of any kind, such as an allergy to 
gadolinium drugs, certain foods or the 
environment. 
 
The radiologist should also know if you have any 
serious health problems or if you have recently 
had surgery. Some conditions, such as severe 
kidney disease, may prevent you from being 
given gadolinium for an MRI. If there is a history of 
severe kidney disease, it may be necessary to 
perform a blood test to determine whether the 
kidneys are functioning adequately. 
 
Women should always inform their radiologist or 
technologist if there is any possibility that they are 
pregnant. 

M R  U r o g r a p h y  


